
SUSTAINABLE 
fORESTRY 
INITlAnVEA Weyerhaeuser 	 ~ 

Corporate Headquarters' 220 Occidental Ave S • Seattle, W A 98104 

March 6, 2017 

Af\N: 31-{)OO I 'e 
pMlW: OR' f{-5W REC'D SCAN 

Susan Speake, Programs Branch 
MAR \ 0 20\7Solid Waste Management Division 

Arkansas Department of Environmental Quality DOC 101: '7 1::107 
5301 Northshore Drive TO::pi E,"« <..eoS SWMD 
North Little Rock, AR 72118-5317 

Re: 	 Weyerhaeuser NR Company-Landfill located in Dierks, AR 

Dear Ms. Speake: 

Weyerhaeuser NR Company, a wholly owned subsidiary of Weyerhaeuser Company, is 

submitting for the director ' s approval, financial assurance for its landfill located in Dierks, Arkansas . As 
provided in APC&EC Regulation 22, Chapter 14, Weyerhaeuser NR Company has used performance 
bonds and a standby trust fund as the mechanism to demonstrate financial assurance. Enclosed are the 

following 

1. 	 Rider to Performance Bond No. 105158618 for the Dierks landfill. Please note that this 
bond has been increased to take into account the inflation factor; and 

2. 	 Certificates of Good Standing for Arkansas and Washington State; and 

3. 	 Copy of Amendment No. 11 to Standby Trust Agreement. I sent triplicate originals of 
the Amendment No. 11 to Tammie J. Hynum of ADEQ and requested that she sign the 
originals, retain one for ADEQ's file and return duplicate originals to my attention. 

Please call me at (206) 539-4202 if you need additional information or have any questions. 

Very truly yours, 

WEYERHAEUSER NR COMPANY 

Deborah M. (Debbie) O'Brien 
Remediation Program Administrator 

Enclosures 
cc: 	 Tammie J. Hynum, ADEQ 

Shelly Boykin, Weyerhaeuser NR Company 

bluek
Text Box



Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America RIDER 
One Tower Square, Hartford, CT 06183 

To be attached to and form a part of: 

Bond No. 105158618 

Type of Bond: ClosurelPost Closure 

Executed by WEYERHAEUSER NR COMPANY , as Principal, 
and by Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America, as Surety, in favor of_____________ 
__________~AR~K~A~N~SA~S~D~E~P~AR~T~M~E~NT ~ anddated_~1~V~29~/~20~0~8___~O~F~E~N~V~IR~o~N~M=EN~T~A=L~ouA~L~IT~y____________ 

In consideration of the premium charged for the attached bond, it is hereby agreed to change: 

amount of Liability 

From: 

Three Hundred Sixty Thousand Four Hundred Sixty and 00/100 ($360,460.00) 


To: 

Three Hundred Sixty Two Thousand Four Hundred Forty Six and 00/100 ($362,446.00) 


This rider is effective ______1/_2_4/_2_0_17_______ 

This rider is executed upon the express condition that the surety's liability under said bond shall not be cumulative and 
shall in no event exceed the amount specifically set forth in said bond or any existing certificate changing thf3 amount of 
said bond . The referenced bond shall be subject to all its agreements, limitations and conditions except as herein 
expressly modified . . 

SIGNED, SEALED AND DATED this _..::2..:c4t::..:.h__ day of __....;J~a;;.;.n::.:ua~ry"--__ --,2~0c.;.1..:c7_ 

WEYERHAEUSER t'{R COMPANY 

By: ,14A-­
+-~~~~~~~~~~~~-------~ 

kRIDER ACCEPTED BY: 

(Obligee) 

Jacqueline W. Hawn, Assistant Secretary 

John W. Lambdin 

Date 

*If Obligee Signature required, please sign duplicate and return to Surety. 


8-1234 (01 -99) 

http:362,446.00
http:360,460.00
bluek
Text Box



WARNING: THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY IS INVALID WITHOUT THE RED BORDER 

This Power of Attorney is granted under and by the authority of the following resolutions adopted by the Boards of Directors of Farmington Casualty Company, Fidelity 
and Guaranty Insurance Company. Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance Underwriters, Inc ., SI. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company, SI. Paul Guardian Insurance 
Company, SI. Paul Mercury Insurance Company, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America , and United States 

Fidelity and Guaranty Company, which resolutions are now in full force and effect, reading as follows: 

RESOLVED, that the Chainnan, the President , any Vice Chairman, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President, any Vice President, any Second Vice 
President, the Treasurer. any Assistant Treasurer, the Corporate Secretary or any Assistant Secretary may appoint Attorneys-in-Fact and Agents to act for and on behalf 
of the Company and may give such appointee sllch authority as his or her certificate of authority may prescribe to sign with the Company's name and seal with the 
Company's seal bonds, recognizances, contracts of indemnity, and other writings obligatory in the nature of a bond, recognizance, or conditional undertaking, and any 
of said officers or the Board of Directors at any time may remove any such appointee and revoke the power given him or her; and it is 

FURTHER RESOLVED , that the Chainnan, the President, any Vice Chairman, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President or any Vice President may 
delegate all or any part of the foregoing authority to one or more officers or employe('s of this Company, provided that each such delegation is in writing and a copy 

thereof is filed in the offlce of the Secretary; and it is 

FURTHER RESOLVED. that any bond, recognizance, contract of indemnity, or writing obligatory in the nature of a bond, recognizance, or conditional undertaking 
shall be valid and binding lIpon the Company when (a) signed by the President, any Vice Chainn3n, any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President or any Vice 
President, any Second Vice President, the Treasurer, any Ass istant Treasurer, the Corporate Sec retary or any Assistant Secretary and duly attested and sealed with the 
Company 's seal by a Secretary or Assistant Secretary; or (b) duly executed (under seal, if required) by one or more Attorneys-in-Fact and Agents pursuant to the power 
prescribed in his or her certificate or their certiticates of authority or by one or more Company offlcers pursuant to a written delegation of authority; and it is 

FURTHER RESOLVED , that the signature of each of the following officers: President , any Executive Vice President, any Senior Vice President, any Vice President, 
any Ass istant Vice President , any Secretary , any Assistant Secretary, and the seal of the Company may be affixed by facsimile to any Power of Attorney or to any 
certificate relating thereto appointing Resident Vice Presidents, Resident Assistant Secretaries or Attorneys-in-Fact for purposes only of executing and attesting bonds 
and undertakings and other writings obligatory in the nature thereof, and any such Power of Attorney or certiticate bearing such facsimile signature or facsimile seal 

shall be valid and binding upon the Company and any such power so exec uted and certifled by such facsimile signature and facsimile seal shall be valid and binding on 
the Company in the future with respect to any bond or understanding to which it is attached . 

I, Kevin E. Hughes . the undersigned , Assistant Secretary, of Farmington Casualty Company, Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance Company, Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance 

Underwriters, Inc., SI. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company, SI. Paul Guardian Insurance Company, SI. Paul Mercury Insurance Company, Travelers Casualty and 
Surety Company, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America, and United Stales Fidelity and Guaranty Company do hereby celtify that the above and foregoing 
is a true and correct copy of the Power of Attorney executed by said Companies , which is in full force and effect and has not been revoked . 

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seals of said Companies this ).~~ day of~ ,2017 

o 
~ 


To verify the authenticity of this Power of Attorney, call 1-800-421-3880 or COntact us at www.travelersbond.com. Please refer to the Attorney-In-Fact number, the 
above-named individuals and the details of the bond to which the power is attached. 

WARNING: THIS POWER OF AITORNEY IS INVALID WITHOUT THE RED BORDER 

http:www.travelersbond.com


WARNING THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY IS INVALID WITHOUT THE RED BORDER 

...... POWER OF ATTORNEY 

TRAVE LERS J Farmington Ca~ualty Company St. Paul Mercury Insurance Compan) 
Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance Company Travelers Casualty and Surety Company 
Fidelity and Guaranty lnsurance Underwriters, Inc, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America 
St. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company United States Fidelity and Guaranty Company 

St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company 

Attorney-[n Fact No. Certificate No. 0 0 6 0 2 5 8 2 0 

22791 J 

KNOW ALl" MEN BY THESE PRESE TS: That Farmington Casualty Company , St. Paul Fire and Marine Insurance Company, St. Paul Guardian In, urance 
ompany, St. Paul Mercury Insurance Company, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company. Trave lers Casualty and Surety Company of' America, and Uni ted States 

Fidelity and Guaranty Company are corporations duly organized under the laws of the State of Connecticut , that Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance Company i.'i a 

corporation duly organized under the laws or the Stat~ of Iowa, and that Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance Underwriters , Inc ., is a corporation duly organized unue r the: 
laws of the tate of Wisconsi n (herein collectively ca lled tile "Companies") , and that the Companies do bereby make, constitute dnd appoint 

John W. Lambdin, Delta D. Hanson , and Joel D. Gaither 

of the City of Federal Way , State of , their true and lawful Attorney(s)-in-Fact . 
each in their separate capacity if more than one is named above, to sign, execute. seal and acknowledge any and all bonds, recognizances. conditional undertakings and 
o ther writings obligatory in the nature thereof on behalf of the Companies in thei r busine. s of guaranteeing the fidel ity of pe rsons . guaranteeing the pe rfomlance of 
contrac ts and executing or guaranteeing bonds and undertakings required or permitted in any actions or proceedings allowed by law. 

IN WIT, ESS WHEREOF, the Companies have caused this instrument to be signed and their corporate seals to be hereto affixed, thi s _____ 1....;9_t_h____ _ 

illl y of A ug ust 2014 

Farmington Casualty Company St. Paul Mercury Insurance Company 
FidelitJ and Guaranty Insurance Company Travelers Casualty and Surety ompany 
Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance Underwriters, Inc . Travelers Casualty and Sllrety Company of America 
St. Paul Fire and Marine lnsurance Company United States Fidelity and Guaranty Company 
St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company 

tate of Connecticut 
'i ly of Hartforu 5S. 

c 
~ 


By: 

On this the 19th day of Aug ust 20 14 . before me personally appeared Roben L. Raney, who acknowledged himself to 
be the Senior Vice President of Farmington Cas ua lty Company, Fidelity and Guaranty Insurance Company , Fidelity and Guarant y Insurance Underw ri ters. Inc. , SI. Paul 
Fire and Marine Insurance Company , St. Paul Guardian Insurance Company, St. Paul Mercury Insurance Company, Travelers Casualty and Surety Company. Travele rs 

asunlty and urety Company of America, and Untted States Fidelity and Guaranty Company, and th at he . as such, being authorized so to do , executed the fo rego ing 
instrument fo r the purposes therein contained by signing on behalf of the corporations by himself as a duly authorized officer. 

e,j~In Witness Whereof, r hereunto set my hand and official seal 
My Commission expires the 30th day of June . 2016. Marie C. Terreau l!. ,'Olary Public 

58440-8-12 Printed in U.S.A 

WARNING: THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY IS INVALID WITHOUT THE RED BORDER 

bluek
Text Box

bluek
Text Box



n 

ecretaryof 

t of "
, . 

I, KIM WYMAN, Secretary S tate of the of Washington and custodian of its 

issue'this 

CERTIFICATE OF 


OF 


WEYERHAEUSER NR COMPANY 


I FURTHER CERTIFY that the on file in this that the named entity 

was under of the State Washington and public organic record 

was filed in Washington and effective on 9/24/2008. 

I 

and that as the records 

duration is Peroetuat 

Secretary 

do not that this entity 

] 

I FURTHER CERTIFY that all interest and state and collected 

through the of State paid. 

CERTIFY most recent delivered to Secretary 

of and that proceedings for administrative are not pending. 

Date: 19,2017 

602-865-829 

Given under my hand and the of the 
ot at Olympia, the State Capltal 

~~ 
Kim Secretary Stale 



of State 

Rock, Arkansas 72201·1094 .50 

Certificate of Good Standing 


State of the State of Arkansas, and as 
do hereby certify that the records 

WEYERHAEUSER NR COMPANY 


state of Washington, and authorized to transact 
For Profit Corporation, was granted a Application 

17,2008. 

Our records 
to transact business in this State. 

having complied with all statutory in the 
of Arkansas, is 

In Testimony \Vhereof, I have hereunto set my 
and my official Seal. Done at my the 

of Little Rock, this 6th day of March 

Mark Martin 
of State 

Online Certificate Authorization Code: b5e982f7072a31 f 

To the Authorization Code, visit 



AMENDMENT II 

STANDBY AGREEMENT 

THIS IS AN AMENDMENT (this "Amendment") dated -I-='''''-'--'!-''''=,t--=--i-~ 2017 
Standby January 8, 

BU,."'':>'''l NR Company, a Washington 
Bank National Association, a national bank ("Trustee"). 

Whereas, the Department of Pollution 
Commission has established regulations applicable to Grantor, that 
an owner or of a solid waste management facility shall provide assurance that 
funds will available when for closure and/or post-closure care of the facility. 

into to document 
their a trust to provide all or part of such 

therein. 

Whereas, Grantor and terms of Standby Trust 
in certain to reflect and post costs of 

as set forth on Schedules and Trustee are entering 
Amendment to memorialize the amendments to the Agreement. 

ST ATEMENT OF AMENDMENT 

consideration premises and the mutual and 
contained herein, and good and valuable consideration, the receipt, mutuality 
and sufficiency which are acknowledged, Grantor and agree as follows: 

1. 	 Schedule "Amount Closure: $326,502" is hereby by deleting 
"$326,502" inserting of Post-Closure 3,958" 
is hereby amended by deleting "$34,149". 

2. 	 Post 

deleting "$2,765,271" inserting 

Action 1 is hereby amended by 

inserting "$8,143,902." 


3. 	 of the Agreement 



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, each of Grantor and caused this 
to duly as of the and first above written. 

Grantor: NR COMPANY 

BY:~~ 
Senior Vice President, 

Counsel and Corporate Secretary 


of Washington ) 

County King ) 

On day 2017, before me, personally came 
by me duly she resides at 

Washington, that she is Senior Vice President, General Counsel and Corporate Secretary 
of Weyerhaeuser NR Company, incorporation described in and which executed 
above instrument; that she knows the of corporation; that the affixed to such 

corporate seal; that it was so by order Board of Directors 
and she her name by 



Bank National Association 

State ) 

of ) 

2017, before me, Nicole Notary 
known to (or proved to me on the 

name IS to within 
the same in his 

Y1U'~HC, the or the 

WITNESS seal. 



Approved and Accepted: 


Arkansas Department of Environmental Quality 




The following original trust 
between Bank National Association 
(Trustee). It is intended to by trust 
agreements. 

Facility Permit Number: I8-S3N 

Facility ID: ARD049662752 

Name and Address: 

P.O. Box 38 
AR 71 3 

Amount of $328,297 

Amount 



information in this schedule standby trust agreement 
Weyerhaeuser NR Company Association 

It is to give specifics about f'f"'''' ..<>r' by the standby trust 

AR06767 13 13 

Address: 

71832 

Post-Closure: 

Action: $8, 



A 

Corporate Headquarters· 220 Occidental Ave S· .......,~"' ..., WA 98104 


6,2017 

Ms. Tammie ], Hynum 

Waste 

Arkansas Department of Environmental Quality 

530 I Northshore Drive 

North Rock, 72118-5317 

Re: 	 Weyerhaeuser NR Company-DeQueen Financial Assurance 
EPA ID#ARD067671313, AFIN: 67-00009, RCRA Permit 25H-RNI 

Dear Ms. Hynum: 

Weyerhaeuser NR Company, a wholly owned subsidiary Weyerhaeuser is 
submitting for the director's approval, financial assurance for its DeQuecn wood products treated facility 

located in DeQueen, Arkansas. As provided in APC&EC Regulation 23, Section Weyerhaeuser 

NR has used performance bonds and a trust fund as the mechanism to 

financial assurance. Enclosed are the following documents: 

l. 	 Rider to Performance Bond No. 105158620 Wood Products Treated 
Facility; 

2. 	 Certificates of Good Standing for Arkansas and Washington State; and 

3. 	 Three originals of Amendment No, 11 to Standby Trust Agreement executed by U.S. 
Bank National Association and Weyerhaeuser Company. The Standby Trust Agreement 
is amended to reflect in financial assurance for the facility set forth on 
"1,,,,'<;;"",1.1," A-4 and the increase in assurance for the facility set on 
A-3. 

Please sign each triplicate original, retain one original for your records, and return two originals to my 
attention at the address I will retain one fully executed Amendment for our records and we are 

to provide one executed Amendment to U.S. 

Weyerhaeuser NR Company 
Attn: Debbie Remediation IJ .."' ............ Administrator 

220 Occidental Ave S 
Seattle, W A 98104 

bluek
Text Box



If you need aOOlUlcmal infonnation or have any questions, please feel free to call me at (206) 539-4202. 

Very truly yours, 

NRCOMPANY 

Deborah M. (Debbie) O'Brien 
Remediation Program Administrator 

Enclosures 
cc: 	Susan Speak, ADEQ /' 

Richard Gay, Weyerhaeuser NR Company 



Travelers Casualty and Surety Company of America 
One Tower Square, Hartford, CT 06183 

To be attached to and form a part or: 

Typeof80nd:~~~~~~~____________________ 

In consideration of the premium charged for the attached bond, it is hereby 10 change: 

From: 

To: 

This rider Is executed the express condilion thai the liability under said bond shall not be cumulative and 
shall in no event amount set forth in said bond or certificate changing the amount of 
said bond. The referenced bond to arl its conditions except as herein 
expressly modified. 

SEALED AND DATED this _.;;;;.;;;.;;",--_day of ___.::.Ja""n.:.:;u.:;:;aryJ-__ --=;.;;;..;.;..._ 

WEYERHAEUSER N,R COMPANY 

"RIDER ACCEPTED BY: 
John W.lamlJdio 

"If Obligee required, duplicate and return to 

bluek
Text Box



WITHOUT THE REO 

POWER OF ATTORNEY 

Flirminllion Cu..ually Compliny 51. Pllul Mercury lruurnnce 
fldl!lity ond GUliflUlly Insurance Company Travelers Cosuolly lind Surely Company 
Fidelity lind GUllfilDly Insurunce Underwriters, Inc. Travelers Cosulllly nnd Surely Com pliny or i\ml:ricu 
51. PUIII !-'ire amI Morine Insurance Compliny United Siules Fidelity lind Guamnly Company 
St. Palll Guurdilln Insurance Compuny 

CertlliclIle No. 0a6a2 5 819 

Fllrm!111!i(1I'l Casually Company. St. Paul Ffl'l: llnd Manne lnsnfiln<:e Company. Pall I 
Ca'lnaity Dnd Surely Company. Travelers Casually and Surety Company of Americn. and 

of Ihe Siale of ConllCcticut. Ihal Fidelity and Guamrlly InSlll"'Jllce Company is D 
Fidelity insllrance Underwriters. Inc,. is a CorpOflllicm org.Zlni:rcd under (he 

-C,Jml):l.nics"') and thai me Companies do hen:by mJlke. con>litu!e ~nd appoim 

under Ibc 

llclitlr.s or proceedi!!!!> 

WIIE,REOF the (;omp.•III,cs hove caused Ihis instrumllrl1 10 be signed !lnt! their corpornlc SC~15 10 be herelo affixed. Ihis _____1_9_lh_____ 
2014 

Farmington CompallY 51. PilU! Mercury Insul"lIncc ComplIny 
Fidelity ol'ld GllarllPly II1!M'allee Company Travelers Casualty Ilnd Surely Compony 
Fldt!illy lind GWll'rlPly Insul"Illlcl! Ulld"rwrlltrs, Inc. Travelers Cosunlly and Su«ly Camptln), of America 
51. Poul Fire !lnd Mllrlne IflJ;Urllnee Company United Siules Fidelity lind GUllmnly CompLlny 
51. Palll Gllllrdillll losllrDnct! CIIJ:npl~ny 

By: 

of 2014 . bdore me personally appeared Robert L. Raney. who acknowledged himself 10 

;;C;;;~i;;C~;;;;;;;;iFF\J~de~l~lI;y;and Gl.l;!fanly Ins!:r.mce Company, Fidelity lind Guamnly Insurance Underwriters. Inc .. 51, P~ul 
LOJ"I'l0J'"V, SI. Paul Gnardian Company. SI. Paul Mercuf)' IIls,ur;lllce Company, Travelers Casualty nnd Surely Company. TrJvc!crs 

Company of America. untl United Slaies Fidelity and Guaranty Company, :md Ihu! he. as such. being aUlhoriz.ed ,0 10 do. excc\Jteu the foregoing 
thereill conl:lincd by signing 011 behalf of the corporalioos by himself as iii duly authorized officer. 

hen:lJnlo sel my hand and official seal, 
lhe 30lh uny of Jone. 2016. 

bluek
Text Box

bluek
Text Box



" 

e eof :: 
Secretary of State 

I, KIM ,,'YMAN, 1.".. ' .. l .... 'W of State ofthe State of Washington and custodian of 

hereby issue'this 

CERTIFICATE OF EXISTENCE 

OF 

WEYERHAEUSER NR COMPAJ\'Y 

n 
seal, 

I FURTHER CERTIFY that on file in this office that the above named entity 

was formed under the laws of the State of Washington and that its public organic record 

was filed in Washington and became effective on 9/24/2008. 

J FURTHER CERTIFY that the entity's duration is Perpetual, 

and that as ofthe date of this certificate, the records of the Secretary of State 

do not reflect this entity has been dissolved. 

I FURTHER CERTIFY that all interest and penalties owed to this state collected 

through the Secretary of State have been paid. 

I FURTHER CERTIFY that the most recent annual report has been delivered to the Secretary 

of State for filing and that proceedings for administrative dissolution are not pending. 

Date: January 19,2017 

UBI: 602-865-829 

Given under my hand and the Seal of the Stale 
of Washington nt Olympin, the Slate '-"'f''''"'' 

~~ 
Kim Wyman, or SUite 



Arkansas Secretary of State 
Mark Martin 

State Capitol Building. Little Rock, Arkansas 72201-1094 • 1-682-3409 

Certificate of Good Standing 

1, Mark Martin, Secretary of State of the State of Arkansas, and as such, keeper of the records 
of domestic and foreign corporations, do hereby certify that the records of this office show 

WEYERHAEUSER NR COMPANY 

formed under the laws of the state of Washington, and authorized to transact business in 
State as a Foreign For Profit Corporation, was a for 
of Authority by this office October 17, 2008. 

Our records reflect that said entity, having complied with all statutory renlcnls in the State 
of Arkansas, is qualified to transact business in State. 

In Testimony Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand 

affixed my official Seal. Done at my office in the 

City of Little Rock, this 6th day ofMarch 2017. 

Mark Martin 

Gilline Certificate Authorization Code: b5e982f7072a31 r 
To the Authorization Code, visit 



AMENDMENT NO. i I 

STANDBY TRUST AGREEMENT 

THIS IS AN AMENDMENT (this "Amendment") dated 2017 
to the Standby Trust Agreement dated January 8,2009 (the and 
between Weyerhaeuser NR Company, a Washington corporation ("Grantor"), and 
Bank National Association, a national bank ("Trustee"). 

RECITALS 

Whereas, the Department of Pollution Control and 
Commission has established applicable to the Grantor, requiring that 
an owner or operator of a solid waste management facility provide assurance that 
funds will be available when needed for closure and/or post-closure care of the facility. 

Whereas, the Grantor and Trustee entered into the Trust Agreement to document 
their agreement for the establishment of a trust to provide all or part of such financial 
assurance the identified therein. 

Whereas, Grantor and desire to amend the tenns of the Standby Trust 
Agreement in certain respects to reflect the change in closure and post closure costs of 

facilities as set forth on Schedules A-3 and A-4, and Grantor and Trustee are entering 
into this Amendment to memorialize the amendments to the Trust Agreement. 

STATEMENT OF AMENDMENT 

In consideration ofthe mutual 
contained herein, and other good and valuable consideration, the receipt, mutuality 
and sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged, Grantor and Trustee agree as follows: 

1. 	 Schedule "Amount ofClosure: $326,502" is hereby amended by deleting 
"$326,502" and inserting and "Amount of $33,958" 
is hereby by deleting "$33,958" inserting "'$34,149". 

2. 	 Schedule A-4, "Amount of Post Closure: $2,765,271" is hereby amended by 
deleting "$2,765,271" and inserting "$2,650,425" and "Amount ofCorrective 
Action "$8,246,148" is hereby amended by deleting "$8,246,148" and 
inserting "$8,143,902." 

3. 	 As hereby amended, all the tenns and provisions ofthe Agreement shalt 
continue in fun force 



IN WITNESS WHEREOF, each ofGrantor Trustee has caused this 
Amendment to be duly executed as of the day and year first above written. 

Grantor: WEYERHAEUSER NR COMPANY 

Senior Vice President, General 
Counsel and Corporate Secretary 

State of Washington ) 
)ss 

County of King ) 

On this 
Kristy Harlan, me duly 

2017, before me, personally came 
that she resides at 

Washington, that she is Senior Vice President, General Counsel and Corporate Secretary 
of Weyerhaeuser NR Company, the incorporation described in and which executed the 
above instrument; that she knows the seal of said corporation~ that the seal affixed to such 
instrument is such corporate seal; that it was so affixed by order the Board of 
of said corporation, and that she signed narne thereto by like order. 



U.S. Bank National Association 

Vice President 

State of Washington ) 
)ss 

County of King ) 

On this 2nd day of February, 2017, before me, Notary Public, 
personally appeared Thomas Zrust, personally known to be (or proved to me on the basis 
of satisfactory evidence) to be the person whose name is subscribed to the within 
instrument and acknowledged to me that he the same in his authorized capacity, 

that by on the instrument, the or the entity, upon behalf of which 
the person acted, executed the instrument. 

WITNESS my hand and official seal. 

Notary Public 
My appointment expires: 



Approved and Accepted: 


Arkansas Department of Environmental Quality 




SCHEDULE A-3 


following infonnation in this schedule relates to the original standby trust agreement 
between the Weyerhaeuser NR Company (Grantor) and National Association 
(Trustee). It is intended to specifics about the facility covered by standby trust 
agreements. 

Facility Permit Number: 0218-S3N 

Facility EPA ID: ARD049662752 

Facility Name and Address: 

Dierks 
P.O. Box 38 
Dierks, AR 7J833 

Amount of Closure: $328,297 

Amount of $34,149 



A-4 


foHowing infonnation in this schedule relates to the original standby trust agreement 
between the Weyerhaeuser NR Company (Grantor) and U.S. Bank National Association 
(Trustee). It is to about the facility covered by the standby trust 

EPA 10: AR06767 I 313 
RCRA Permit 

Facility Name Address: 

DeQueen Wood Treating 
P.O. Box 387 

DeQueen, AR 71832 


Amount of $2,650,425 

Amount of Corrective Action: $8,]43,902 




