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Syngamoniasis 
in Tourist 

To the Editor: Mammonogamus
laryngeus (Syngamus laryngeus) is a
nematode parasite found in the larynx
of tropical mammals (1), especially
cattle and cats and occasionally
humans (2). We report a case in a 65-
year-old Caucasian man who visited
Brazil from July 20 to September 9,
2004. The patient stayed in Rio de
Janeiro and Ilhéus in northern Brazil.
He ate local food, including salads,
raw vegetables and fruits, and drank
what he assumed was safe water.

Upon return to Portugal in
September 2004, the patient experi-
enced a cough and fever. He was seen
in an emergency service and chest
radiograph indicated infiltration in the
left inferior lobe, the right basal
hilum, and right apex. A complete
blood count revealed a leukocyte
count of 9,700/mm3, 81% polymor-
phonuclear leukocytes and 2.1%
eosinophils. He was treated with
antimicrobial drugs; a week later a
radiograph showed bronchovascular
markings. The patient failed to follow
recommendations and in mid-
October, he returned to the hospital

with a persistent cough and expecto-
ration.

In late November the patient had a
persistent cough with hemoptysis. He
was given antimicrobial drugs; a com-
puted tomographic scan showed an
infiltration, a sequela to pneumonia,
localized in the left superior lobe.
Symptoms persisted, and bronchofi-
broscopic examination in January
2005 showed thickening of the bilat-
eral bronchovascular bundles and dis-
crete diffuse inflammation in the
bronchial mucosa. A Y-shaped worm,
moving and wrapped in viscous,
bloody mucus, was seen around the
right medial bronchus. A worm was
seen in the left main bronchus and,
upon closer examination, a male and
female worm in copula were seen.
The worms removed with forceps and
identified as M. laryngeus (Figure).
Eggs from the female were character-
istic of the species.

The patient was treated with alben-
dazole 200 mg, 3×/day for 3 days, fol-
lowed by mebendazole 100 mg,
3×/day for 3 days. The cough and
hemoptysis clinically improved and
abated by early February.

The genus Mammomonogamus
consists of 2 major species, M. laryn-
geus and M. nasicola. The former is a
parasite of the laryngotracheal region
of bovids and felines, and the latter is
found in the nasal fossa of bovids. M.
laryngeus and M. nasicola belong to
the family Syngamidae that contains
the gapeworm of birds, S. trachea.

Possibly 100 human infections (3),
most caused by M. larygeus, have
been reported from the Caribbean
Islands and South America, especially
Brazil, with other reports from
Australia, Canada, the United States,
France, United Kingdom (4), the
Philippines (2), Thailand (5), and
Korea (6). Many of the cases reported
outside of the Caribbean and South
America were usually acquired while
the patient was visiting areas where
M. larygeus was endemic. Naturally
infected ruminant host are found in
tropical America, India, Africa,
Malaysia, the Philippines, and
Vietnam (7).

M. laryngeus is blood red; the
males are joined permanently to the
female and are characteristically Y
shaped (Figure). The males are ≈3 mm
and the females are ≈10 mm in length.
The mouth opening is wide, and the
buccal capsule is cup-shaped with
8–10 small teeth. The worms attach to
the mucosa of the larynx in animals
and cause bronchitis and cough.

The means of transmission of M.
laryngeus is unknown but it is
assumed to be similar to that of S. tra-
chea, which is acquired by ingesting
an embryonated egg, hatched larvae,
or a paratenic host such as earth-
worms, snails, or arthropods. The
patient in our case could have been
infected by eating contaminated raw
vegetation or drinking contaminated
water while traveling through Brazil.
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Figure. Male and female Mammonogamus
laryngeus recovered from the bronchial
mucosa.
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The life cycle of M. laryngeus is not
completely known, but it is assumed
to be similar to S. trachea, which pen-
etrates the intestinal wall and migrates
through the body of the animal to the
tracheolaryngeal region (8). Eggs pro-
duced are deposited in the tracheal
mucosa, swallowed, and pass in the
feces.

Chronic cough and fever are the
major symptoms associated with M.
laryngeus in humans, with occasional
reports of hemoptysis when the
worms are in the bronchus. Worms in
the larynx may cause irritation and a
crawling or scratching sensation.
Symptoms of asthma have been
reported, and leukocytosis and
eosinophilia may occur. Our patient
had respiratory symptoms, persistent
cough, and hemoptysis, without
leukocytosis or eosinophilia.

The diagnosis of parasitosis is usu-
ally made by finding expectorated
worms or visualizing by bron-
choscopy and removal by forceps.
Eggs may be found in sputum or
feces. In our case, eggs were not
found in sputum or feces.

The worms are coughed up by the
patient or removed with forceps dur-
ing bronchoscopy. When anti-
helmintics such as mebendazole and
albendazole have been used, patients
have reported improvement.

Although mammomonogamiasis
may not be considered an emerging
parasitosis, physicians should be
aware of the condition especially in
patients with pulmonary symptoms
who visited disease-endemic areas.
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Human
Angiostrongylus

cantonensis,
Jamaica 

To the Editor: Angiostrongylus
cantonensis is the most common
cause of eosinophilic meningoen-
cephalitis worldwide (1). The para-

site’s presence has been well docu-
mented in Jamaica in rats (definitive
host) and a variety of mollusks (inter-
mediate hosts); infections occur in
humans sporadically on the island.
However, the mode of transmission of
infections to humans in Jamaica,
where raw or undercooked mollusks
are not usually eaten, is not well
understood (2).

An outbreak of A. cantonensis
occurred among American medical
students vacationing in Jamaica in
2000. An epidemiologic investigation
identified the probable source of infec-
tion (Caesar salad), but no biologic
contaminant was determined (2).
During a field investigation of A. can-
tonensis, we spoke with local farmers
and vendors to identify possible routes
of food contamination. While our
observations were preliminary and
anecdotal in nature, our findings pro-
vide valuable insight into local trans-
mission and control of this parasite.

Humans can become infected by
eating the intermediate hosts, slugs
and snails, of A. cantonensis.
Freshwater shrimp serve as paratenic
hosts and reservoirs of infection for
humans, both naturally and experi-
mentally (3,4). Most reports of
Jamaican eating practices indicate
that terrestrial snails and slugs are not
eaten and that shrimp and other meats
are always eaten well cooked (5).
However, during interviews with a
farmer near Mavis Bank, a rural area
outside of Kingston, and fishermen at
the Coronation Market, Jamaica’s
largest fresh produce market, we dis-
covered that freshwater and saltwater
shrimp, as well as mussels (paratenic
hosts), are occasionally eaten raw.
Freshwater shrimp or mussels are
eaten, particularly by men, directly
from rivers and streams, and freshwa-
ter and saltwater bait shrimp are eaten
by fishermen.

In Jamaica, molluscicides are rou-
tinely applied to growing vegetables
such as cabbage, lettuce, and bok
choy to keep snails and slugs away,
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